ORDINANCE NO. 2013-09
INTRODUCED BY: Mayor and Council as a Whole

AN EMERGENCY ORDINANCE
TO APPROVE CURRENT REPLACEMENT PAGES TO THE
MAYFIELD VILLAGE CODIFIED ORDINANCES.

WHEREAS, certain provisions within the Codified Ordinances should be amended to
conform with current State law as required by the Ohio Constitution; and

WHEREAS, vartous ordinances of a general and permanent nature have been passed by
Council which should be included in the Codified Ordinances; and

WHEREAS, the Village has heretofore entered into a contract with the Walter H. Drane
Company to prepare and publish such revision which is before Council;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF MAYFIELD
VILLAGE, OHIO, THAT:

SECTION 1. The ordinances of the Municipality of Mayfield Village, Ohio, of a general
and permanent nature, as revised, recodified, rearranged and consolidated into component codes,
titles, chapters and sections within the 2013 Replacement Pages to the Codified Ordinances are
hereby approved and adopted.

SECTION 2. The following sections and chapters are hereby added, amended or repealed
as respectively indicated in order to comply with current State law.

Traffi¢c Code
301.031 Beacon; Hybrid Beacon. (Added)
301.161 Highway Traffic Signal. (Added)
301.17 Intersection. (Amended)

301.181 Median. (Added)
301.26(b) Private Road or Driveway. (Added)
301.361 Shared-Use Path. (Added)

301.45 Traffic (Amended).

301.46 Traffic Control Device. (Amended)

301.47 Traffic Control Signal. (Amended)

303.01 Compliance With Order of Police Officer. (Amended)
303.041 Emergency, Public Safety and Coroner’s Vehicles Exempt. (Amended)
303.99 General Traffic Code Penalty. (Amended)

313.03 Traffic Signal Indications. (Amended)

313.04 Lane-Use Control Signal Indications. {Amended)
313.05 Special Pedestrian Control Signals. (Amended)
313.06 Flashing Traffic Signals. (Repealed)

331.12 U-Turns Restricted. (Amended)

335.07 Driving Under License Suspension or Restriction. (Amended)



ORDINANCE NO. 2013-09

PAGE 2

335.072

335.074

339.03
341.01
341.03
341.05

501.01
501.02
501.11
501.13
513.03
513.12
517.01
517.02
517.05
517.06
517.07
517.08
317.09
517.10
517.11
517.13
517.15
525.01
529.021
529.04
529.07
533.08
533.09
537.12
5345.05
549.13

1511.05

Driving Under Financial Responsibility L.aw Suspension or Cancellation.

{(Amended)

Driving Under License Forfeiture or Child Support Suspension.

{Amended)
Maximum Width, Height and Length. (Amended)
Commercial Vehicle Definitions. (Amended)

Prerequisites to Operation of a Commercial Motor Vehicle. (Amended)

Commercial Drivers’ Criminal Offenses. (Amended)

(General Offenses Code

Definitions. (Amended)

Classification of Offenses. (Amended)
Organizational Criminal Liability. (Amended)
Conspiracy. (Added)

Drug Abuse; Controlled Substance Possession. (Amended)
Marihuana Drug Paraphernalia. (Added)

Gambling Definitions (Amended)

Gambling. (Amended)

Cheating. (Amended)

Methods of Conducting a Bingo Game. (Amended)
Instant Bingo Conduct. (Amended)

Raffles. (Amended)

Charitable Instant Bingo Organizations. (Amended)
Location of Instant Bingo. (Amended)

Bingo or Game of Chance Records. (Amended)
Bingo Exceptions. (Amended)

Skill-Based Amusement Machines. (Amended)
Law Enforcement and Public Office Definitions. (Amended)
Purchase by Minors. (Amended)

Liquor Consumption in Motor Vehicle. (Amended)
Open Container Prohibited. (Amended})

Procuring. (Amended)

Soliciting. (Amended)

Misuse of 9-1-1 System. (Amended}

Petty Theft. (Amended)

Possessing Replica Firearms in School. (Added)

Fire Prevention Code

Open Bumning; Recreational Fires; Portable Outdoor
(Amended)

Fireplaces.



CODIFIED

ORDINANCES
OF
MAYFIELD VILLAGE
OHIO
®

Complete to January 1, 2013

Exhibit A



ORDINANCE NO. 2013-09
PAGE 3

SECTION 3. The complete text of the sections listed above are set forth in full in the
current replacement pages to the Codified Ordinances which are hereby attached to this
ordinance as Exhibit A. Notice of adoption of each new section by reference to its title shall
constitute sufficient publication of new matter contained therein.

SECTION 4. The Council finds and determines that all formal actions of this Council
relating to the adoption of this Ordinance have been taken at open meetings of this Council; and
that deliberations of this Council and of its committees, resulting in such formal action, took
place in meetings open to the public, in compliance with all statutory requirements including the
requirements of Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised Code.

SECTION J3. This ordinance is hereby declared to be an emergency measure necessary
for the preservation of the public peace, health and safety of the Municipality and its inhabitants
for the reason that there exists an imperative necessity for the earliest publication and distribution
of current Replacement Pages to the officials and residents of the Municipality, so as to facilitate
administration, daily operation and avoid practical and legal entanglements.

LA e

WILLIAM BUCKHOLTZ, Coundi! President

First Reading: May 20, 2013

Second Reading: Suspended 2013
. . Suspended

Third Reading: 2013

HASSED: May 20, - 2013

BRUCE G. RINKER, Mayor

;&PP'ROV

\/

(AT :
(DIREQ’(F(ﬁI OF LAW

ATTEST:WM/
MARY EUBETSA, Clerk of Council




We, Bruce Rinker, Mayor, and Mary Beth Betsa, Council Clerk, of Mayfield Village,
Ohio, pursuant to Ohio Revised Code 731.23 and 731.42, hereby certify that the general and
permanent ordinances of Mayfield Village, Ohio, as revised, rearranged, compiled, renumbered
as to sections, codified and printed herewith in component codes are correctly set forth and
constitute the Codified Ordinances of Mayfield Village, Ohio, 1987, as complete to January 1,
2013.

/s/  Bruce Rinker
Mayor

s/ Mary Beth Betsa
Council Clerk

Codified, edited and prepared for
publication by
THE WALTER H. DRANE COMPANY
Cleveland, Ohio

Copyright, 1987, by
The Walter H. Drane Company

2013 Replacement



LSS

Ward 1
Ward 2
Ward 3
Ward 4
At Large
At Large
At Large

Finance Director
Law Director
Prosecutor
Police Chief
Service Director

ROSTER OF OFFICIALS

MAYFIELD VILLAGE, OHIO

(2013)

MAYOR

Bruce Rinker
COUNCIL

OFFICIALS

Building Commissioner

Engineer
Clerk of Council

Parks and Recreation Director
Director of Administration

William Marquardt
Lillian (Patsy) Mills
Dr. Stephan Parker
William Buckholtz
Nick Delguyd
Joanne Cinco
Thomas Marrie

Ronald C. Wynne
Joseph Diemert
Vincent Feudo
Richard Edelman
Douglas Metzung
John Marrelli
Thomas Cappello
Mary Beth Betsa
William Thomas
Diane Wolgamuth

2013 Repiacement



The publisher
expresses his appreciation
to

JOSEPH W. DIEMERT
Director of Law

- MARY BETH BETSA
Clerk of Council

and ali other Mayfield Village officials
who gave their time and counsel to the
1987 codification
and the preparation of current
replacement pages.

2013 Replacement



15 GENERAL INDEX

BUILDING PERMIT (Cont.)

grading approval required 1309.12
landscaping plans required 1309.08
rain barrel systems 1309.24

underground utilities completed

prior to 1119.19
BUMPER HEIGHTS 337.2%
BUMPERS 337.01(d)

BURNING (see OPEN BURNING)
BURNS (see WOUNDS AND BURNS)
BUS (see also COMMERCIAL AND

HEAVY VEHRICLE)
defined 301.05
school bus
defined 301.35
discharging children 331.38
driving regulations 331.38
stopping for 331.38
BUSINESS

fees; bonds; insurance 767.705
hours of operation prohibited  705.01
BUSINESS DISTRICT

defined 301.06
speed ©333.03
BUSINESS DISTRICT, LOCAL (see

also ZONING DISTRICTS)
applicability of other

regulations 1165.09(a)
area regulations; lots 1165.04
conflicting regulations 1165.09(b)
development plans 1165.08
intent 1165.01
regulations established;

conformance 1165.02
uses permitted 1165.03
yard regulations 1165.05

CABLE TELEVISION CUSTOMER

SERVICE STANDARDS
customer dissatisfaction
with service 046.04
definitions 946.02
penalty 946.99
policy 946.01
safety 946.05
standards 046.03
CABLE TELEVISION
REGULATIONS
permit fees; bond; insurance 977.945,
977.946
rates and charges
adoption 766.01
copies 766.02
public comment 766.03
schedule 767.766

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 16

CALENDAR, VILLAGE

meeting dates on 103.02
posting and mailing 103.03
CAMPER (see RECREATIONAL
VEHICLE)
CANDY
adulterated 537.13
CANVASSING (see SOLICITING OR
CANVASSING)
CARNIVAL (see ENTERTAINMENT)
CARRYING CONCEALED
WEAPONS 549.02
CAR SEAT, CHILDREN'S 337.26
CAT (see ANIMALS)
CATTLE (see ANIMALS)
CELL PHONE

texting while driving prohibited 331.43
use prohibited while driving 331.44
CEMETERY

Mayfield Union Cemetery

District Ch. 965
permit fee; bond; insurance 977.965

CHARTER

amendments Chtr. X
effective date Chtr. XII-1
effect on existing laws and

rights Chrr. XII-3
interpretation Chtr. XII-3
Review Commission Chtr. XI

revised copies distributed Chtr. XII-9.1
savings clause Chtr. XII-6
CHAUFFEUR'’S LICENSE (see
DRIVER’S LICENSE)

CHEATING 517.05
CHECKS (see also FINANCE)
passing bad 545.09

CHILDREN (see JUVENILE; MINOR)
CHILD RESTRAINT SYSTEM 337.26
CHURCH

yard or parking lot,
prohibited conduct 500.09
CIGARETTES (see TOBACCO
PRODUCTS)

CITIZENS ADVISORY COMMITTEE
established; members 131.04
Mayor, supervision by and

advice to 131.04

CIVIL RIGHTS

interfering with 525.13

2013 Replacement

CIVIL SERVICE COMMISSION

classification of service  Chtr. V-6(B)
composition; term;
removal Chtr. V-6(A)
duties Chtr. V-6(C)
established Chtr. V-1
CLERK OF COUNCIL (see
COUNCIL)
CODIFIED ORDINANCES (see also
ORDINANCES AND
RESOLUTIONS)
amendment, effect of 101.04
calendar 101.03
citation 101.01
conflicting provisions 101.06
definitions, general 101.01
headings 101.01
legislative intent 101.07
penalty, general 101.99
repeal, effect of 101.04
revivor 101.04
rules of construction 101.03
section references 101.05
severability 101.08
time computation 101.03
COERCION 537.09
COIN MACHINE
definition 545.01
slug use 545.11
tampering 545.12
COMMERCIAL AND HEAVY
VEHICLE
air cleaner required 337.25
brakes 337.18
bumper heights 337.29
chains, spikes or lugs 339.10
definitions 341.01
driver (see COMMERCIAL
DRIVERS)
explosives, transporting 339.06
height, maximum 339.03
hitchhikers prohibited 339.12(i)
length, maximum 339.03

lights (see VEHICLE LIGHTS)

loading areas (see OFF-STREET
LOADING)

loads (see VEHICLE LOADS)

local streets, use 339.02

markings required 339.12(H

motor transportation company  339.12



17 GENERAL INDEX

COMMERCIAL AND HEAVY VEHICLE

(Cont.)
mud flaps 339.05
mud, tracking 339.08

parking in residential districts 1157.07
permit, special 339.01, 339.02
private motor carriers 339.12
radioactive material transport (see

RADIOCACTIVE MATERIALS)
road service vehicle 301.321, 333.031
route information on request 339.04
slower vehicles to use

right lane 331.01
slow-moving, lights and emblem 337.10
snow plows (see SNOW PLOW

OPERATORS)
State route, use 339.01, 339.02
towing requirements 339.07
truck defined 301.49
truck routes 339.02
wheel protectors 339.05
width, maximum 339.03
COMMERCIAL DRIVERS
criminal offenses 341.05
definitions 341.01
employment 341.06
exemptions 341.02
operation 341.03
prohibitions 341,04
COMMERCIAL ESTABLISHMENT
waste containers; fees 767.701
COMMISSION ON AGING
advisory to Council 147.04
Chairman 147.04
Coordinator 147.02(a)
established Chir. V-1, 147.01
funding 147.06
meetings 147.05
members
age qualifications 147.02(a)
compensation 147.03
term 147.02(b)
powers and duties 147.04
quorum 147.05
COMMISSIONS (see BOARDS AND
COMMISSIONS)
COMMUNITY FACILITIES
PLAN 1117.10

COMMUNITY ROOM (see SENIOR
CENTER AND COMMUNITY
ROOM BUILDING)
COMPANIES (see ORGANIZATIONS)
COMPENSATION

improper 525.11
COMPLICITY 501.10
COMPOUNDING A CRIME 525.04
COMPUTER CRIMES 501.01, 545.01
COMPUTER, LAPTOP OR TABLET

(see ELECTRONIC WIRELESS
COMMUNICATION
DEVICE)

CONDOMINIUM (see also DWELLING)
Building Code compliance  1379.04(b)
certificate of occupancy 1379.04(b), (c)
definitions 1379.03
developer’s right of access  1379.06(k)

equal opportunity 1379.08
Housing Code compliance  1379.04(c)
legal remedies 1379.09
notice of conversion 1379.06
penalty 1379.99
public offering statement
amendments 1379.05(b)
disclosures 1379.05(a)
filing; fee 1379.04(a)
promotional use 1379.05(c)

purchasers, delivered
to 1379.06(m)
tenants, delivered to 1379.06(g)
purchaser’s right to cancel 1379.06(n)
regulations

applicability 1379.02(c)
construction 1379.02(a)
purpose 1379.01
severability 1379.02(b)
tenants, protection of 1379.06
unjawful representations 1379.07
warranty compliance; ;
escrow account 1379.04(d)
CONFLICT OF INTEREST 525.15
CONSTRUCTION (see also
BUILDING)
Building Code (see BUILDING
CODE, OHIG)
deposit required for
damage; waste or dirt
removal 1309.06
professional services 1309.07

dirt or trash deposited on
street 521.07
driveways required before 1369.01

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 18

CONSTRUCTION (Cont.} CORONER'’S VEHICLE
Engineer inspections; exemptions 303.041
deposit 1309.19 right of way 331.21
excavation, grading, filling, CORPORATION (sce ORGANIZATION)
permit fees 1309.09 COUNCIL (see also PUBLIC SERVANT)
flood areas {see FL.OOD Clerk
HAZARD AREAS) appointment; duties Chtr. II1I-6
grades (see GRADING) attendance at meetings 121.01¢h)
inspection fees 1309.05(g) records kept Chtr. III-8(A)
landscaping required 1309.18 committees
occupancy before completion  1309.18 standing; special 121.06
permit (see BUILDING PERMIT) subpoena of witnesses 121.09
sidewalks (see SIDEWAILK) departments, boards,
soil removal (see SOIL REMOVAL) commissions Chtr. V-1
stop work order 1329.07 emplovees of Chtr. III-16
swimming pool (see SWIMMING Fire and Police Department
POOL) response outside
trailers Village 121.12
defined 1347.01 journal Chtr. TH-8(A)
enclosure 1347.02 legislative powers Chtr. HI-10
penalty 1347.99 meetings
permit adjournment 121.08
application; period 1347.03 advance notification 103.04, 103.05
trash containers or agenda 121.01(H)
enclosures 1363.05 dates on Village calendar 103.02(a)
vehicular assault in debate rules 121.04
construction zone 537.021 location 103.02(b)
CONTRACT (see also FINANCE) Mayor’s attendance Chtr. IV-4
advertising for bids; award 123.02 order of business 121.01()
conflict of interest Chtr. XII-7 parliamentary procedure 121.07
interest, unlawful 525.10 regular Chtr. HI-8(A), 121.01(a)
Law Director approval of form regulations 121.01
and legality 121.03 special Chtr. III-8(B), 121.01(b)
CONTRACTOR special, news media
certificate of registration notified 103.02(c), 103.05
appeal 1313.03 members
application 1313.02 compensaticn Chtr. II-7
exceptions 1313.07 composition Chtr. II-1
fee 1309.05(g) conflict of interest 525.15
insurance qualifications Chtr. 11I-4
evidence of - 1309.23 quorum  Chtr. III-8(A), 121.01(m)
required 1313.05 removal Chtr. II-17
renewal 1313.04 term Chtr. I1I-1
required 1313.01 vacancies - Chtr. I11-9
revocation; suspension 1313.06 minutes 121.02
home improvement municipal government
definitions 1315.01 education Chtr. XII-2
penalty 1315.99 Municipal vehicle title,
prohibition 1315.02 permission to transfer  121.10
CONTROL ordinances (see ORDINANCES
physical 333.01 AND RESOLUTIONS)
reasonable 331.34, 333.08

2013 Replacement

Ry

. .
R—



e

19 GENERAL INDEX

COUNCIL (Cont.)
organization Chtr. III-5
power to levy taxes limited Chtr. IX-2
President

bond 153.01
disputes with Mayor 121.11
Presiding Officer, as 121.01(g)
selection; duties Chtr. [II-15
succeeds Mayor in
vacancy Chtr. IV-8
President Pro Tem; selection,
succession Chtr. [1I-15
purchases, approval of 123.02
salaries and compensation
fixed by Chtr. I1I-7
Traffic Code powers reserved  305.07
traffic control powers 305.01
transition of Chtr. III-2
unsafe structures hearing 1353.11
variances 1149.08
voting 121.05
Zoning powers Chtr. V-12.1
COUNTERFEIT CONTROLLED
SUBSTANCES 513.13
COURT, MUNICIPAL
editor’s note Ch. 161
CREDIT CARD
misuse 545.10
CRIME (see OFFENSE)
CRIMINAL DAMAGING AND
ENDANGERING 541.03
CRIMINAL MISCHIEF 541.04
CRIMINAL SIMULATION 545.13
CRIMINAL TOOLS 545.19
CROSSWALK
defined 301.09
obstructing 331.33
parking on prohibited 351.03(¢e), (f)
pedestrian right of way 371.01
CRUELTY
animals 505.21
children 537.07
CULPABILITY
criminal liability 501.07
knowingly 501.08(b)
mental states 501.08
negligently 501.08(d)
purposely 501.08(a)
recklessly 501.08(c)

CULVERTS (see DRAINAGE)

CURBS AND GUTTERS
driving over 331.37
parking on prohibited 351.03(a)
subdivision regulations 1119.09(b)
CURFEW
generally 509.08
probationary driver’s license  335.031
temporary instruction permit 335.03
CUSTODY (see MINOR) '
DANGEROUS ORDNANCE (see also
WEAPONS)
defined - 549.01
exceptions 549.01(k)
failure to secure 549.05
possession 545.19(b)

DEFINITIONS (see also individual
subject involved)
Codified Ordinances, general 101.01

Subdivision Regulations Ch. 1113

Traftic Code Ch. 301

Zoning Code 1145.01
DEFRAUDING

creditors 545.17

DEPARTMENTS (see also individual
department involved)
continuance under new

Charter Chtr. XII-2
established; Council powers Chtr. V-1
DERELICTION OF DUTY 525.12
DESECRATION 541.07
DETENTION
defined 525.01
shoplifters 545.04
DIRECTOR OF
ADMINISTRATION 131.01
DIRT BIKE (see MOTORCYCLE,
OFF-HIGHWAY)
DISH ANTENNA (see TELEVISION)
DISORDERLY CONDUCT
disturbing others 509.03
inducing panic 509.06
intoxicated persons 509.03
riot (see RIOT)
DISTURBING THE PEACE
muffler noise 337.20
racing vehicle motor 331.36
squealing tires, peeling 331.36
vehicle exhaust noise 331.36
DOGS (see ANIMALS)
DOMESTIC VIOLENCE 537.14
DRAG RACING 333.07

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 20

DRAINAGE (see also DRAINAGE AND DRIVEWAY (Cont.)
INFRASTRUCTURE) right of way
compliance required 521.05 entering 331.17
culverts required 1369.01 leaving 331.22, 331.23
flood hazard areas  1125.13, 1125.14 subdivision regulations 1119.09(c)
subdivisions turning into 331.11
drainage ways 1117.10(c) DRIVING
natural drainage 1117.02(b) accident (see ACCIDENT)
open system 1119.04(b) allowing another to drive
DRAINAGE AND INFRASTRUCTURE illegally 335.05
Drainage and Infrastructure approaching stationary public safety,
: Committee 955.04 emergency, road
funding 955.07 service vehicle 333.031
improvements assured clear distance  331.09, 333.03
drainage 955.03 backing vehicle 331.13
infrastructure 955.02 bicycle trails, on 331.41
performance 955.06 cell phone use prohibited 331.43
permit fee; bond; insurance 977.955 certificate of title required 335.08
project evaluations; priority 955.05 change of course 331.14, 331.34
purpose 955.01 closed road, on 331.26
DRIVER’S LICENSE construction zone,
application falsification 335.04(e) vehicular assauit in 537.021
display 335.06 control of vehicle 331.34, 333.08
fictitious, revoked, altered 335.04(a) crosswalk, obstructing 331.33
lending 335.04(b) divided street 331.31
motorcycle, off-highway 375.05 drag racing 333.07, 509.09
motorcycle operator 335.01(a) driver’s view, control  331.25, 337.21
motorized bicycle 379.01 drunk or drugged 333.01
nonresident driver 335.01(b) earplugs or earphones prohibited 331.42
permitting operation without 335.02 electronic wireless communication
possession device use prohibited while
more than one 335.02 driving 331.44
someone else’s 335.04(c) entering or crossing roadway
probationary; curfew 335.031 from other than roadway
prohibited acts 335.04 duty to yield 331.22
required 335.01 stopping at sidewalk 331.23
restriction violation 335.01(c) exhaust noises 331.36
revoked or suspended financial responsibility law
driving with 335.07 suspension or cancellation,
failure to surrender 335.04(d) driving under 335.072
reinstatement requirements, fire hose, over 331.28
noncompliance with 335.073 following
snowmobile or all purpose emergency or safety vehicle 331.27
vehicle 375.05 too closely 331.09
suspended, driving under 335.074 grade crossing 331.39, 331.40
temporary, licensed driver hazardous zones 331.07
required 335.03 intersection
DRIVEWAY obstructing 331.33
building construction, right of way 331.16
required before 1369.01 shortcutting 331.41
construction permit fee 1309.05(g) turning at 331.10
parking in front of 351.03 lanes, within 331.08
left side of street 331.06

2013 Replacement



21 GENERAL INDEX

DRIVING (Cont.} DRIVING (Cont.)
motorized bicycle (see MOTORIZED weaving 331.34
BICYCLE) willful, wanton disregard 333.02
motor racing 509.09 wrongful entrustment
one-way street 331.30 of a motor vehicle 335.05
operate defined 301.201 yellow line 331.07
OVI suspension, under 335.071 yield signs, operation at 331.18
parade or procession, through 311.02(d) DRUG ABUSE
passing adulterated food 537.13
left of center 331.05 attempt 501.09(e)
left side 331.03 " controlled substance test; :
10 passing zones 331.07 offender to pay 513.15
right side 331.02, 331.04 counterfeit controlled substances 513.13
racing motor 331.36 dangerous drugs 513.06
reckless definitions 513.01
failure to control ~ 331.34, 333.08 driving under influence - 333.01
full time and attention 331.34 Drug Law Enforcement Fund  513.14
prohibited 333.09 drug samples 513.08
willful, wanton disregard  333.02 explosive handlers, by 1361.08
right of way fines, allocation of 513.14
funeral procession 331.24 fireworks exhibitor, by 1519.03
intersections 331.16 hypodermic, possession and
public safety vehicle 331.21 dispensing 513.04, 513.10
turning left : 331.17 instruments 313.04
right side of street 331.01 intoxicants, harmful
rotary traffic island, around 331.30 nitrous oxide in vehicle 513.11
safety zone, through 331.29 possession or use 513.07
shortcutting 331.41 labels, prescription , 513.09
sidewalk, street lawn, curb; on 331.37 marihuana
signals for turning or gift , 513.02
stopping 331.14, 331.15 illegal cultivation 513.06
speed (see SPEED) paraphernalia sale to juvenile 513.12
squealing tires 331.36 possession or use 513.03
starting vehicle 331.13 paraphernalia
stop signs defined 513.01(dd)
emergency or public marijuana 513.12
safery vehicle 331.20 possession, manufacture,
operation at 331.14, 331.19 sale 513.045
street under repair 331.26 penalty 513.99
sudden starts or stops 509.09 permitting 513.05
suspended license 335.074 police held property,
texting prohibited 331.43 disposition of 139.04(d)
traffic control device, possession or use 513.03
nonworking or walking on street under
ambiguous 313.10 influence 371.09
turning weapon using while intoxicated 549.03
driveway, alley or building 331.11 DRUNK DRIVING 333.01
intersection, at 331.10 DUI : 333.01
left, right of way 331.17 DWELLING (see also BUILDING)
right on red 313.03(c) apartments
right on red prohibited 313.09 floor area 1181.04
signals 331.14, 331.15 street access 1181.05
U turn 331.12 building permit (see BUILDING
unsafe vehicle 337.01 PERMIT)

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 22

DWELLING (Cont.)
condominiums (see CONDOMINIUM)

definitions 1113.08
districts (see RESIDENTIAL ’
DISTRICTS)

garage (see GARAGE)

living area, minimum 1367.01

lot regulations (see LOTS)

maintenance
accessory structures; fences 1353.06
foundations 1353.03
insect and rodent free 1353.05
penalty 1353.99
property areas, exterior 1353.07
required 1353.02
roofs 1353.04(b)
walls, exterior 1353.04(a)

occupancy before completion  1309.18
occupancy certificate (see
OCCUPANCY CERTIFICATE)
sale, sewage system
inspection Ch. 1365
street access 1181.05
unsafe (see UNSAFE STRUCTURES)
yards (see YARDS)
DWELLING CODE (see RESIDENTIAL

CODE FOR ONE AND TWO-
FAMILY DWELLINGS)
DWELLING SEWAGE SYSTEM
INSPECTION CERTIFICATE
application 1365.02(a)
compliance 1365.05
contents 1365.02(b)
disbursement of funds,
without 1365.05
fee 1365.03
DWELLING SEWAGE SYSTEM
INSPECTION
CERTIFICATE (Cont.)
liability limitation : 1365.06
penalty 1365.99
required 1365.01
validity length 1365.02(c)
ELECTIONS
ballots Chtr. VI
Charter amendments Chir. X
Council members Chtr. 1111, 3
initiative . Chtr. VH-1
nomination petitions Chtr. VI, VII-3
recall Chtr, VII-7
referendurn Chtr. VII-2
State law governs Chtr. VI

2013 Replacement

ELECTIONS (Cont.)
zoning amendments submitted
to electorate Chitr. 11I-14
ELECTRICAL ASSISTANT INSPECTOR
position established; supervision,

discharge 1301.02
ELECTRICAL WORK
Code (see NATIONAL ELECTRICAL
CODE)
permit fees 1309.05(d)

ELECTRICITY (see also UTILITIES)
permit fee; bond; insurance 977.931
Subdivision Regulations 1119.07

ELECTRIC PERSONAL ASSISTIVE

MOBILITY DEVICE (see also
WHEELCHAIR)

regulations 371.12

ELECTRONIC WIRELESS
COMMUNICATION DEVICE

texting while driving prohibited 331.43

use prohibited while driving 331.44
EMBLEM

motor vehicle, illegal use 525.14
EMERGENCY

civil; Mayor’s powers 509.11
false alarm 509.07
hazardous material spill, etc. (see

HAZARDOUS MATERIALS)
misconduct at 509.05
misuse of 911 system 537.12
recovery costs; hazardous

materials 767.749
Police and Fire Department to aid

other municipalities 121.12
traffic direction 303.02

EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES
TO NON-RESIDENTS
charges 1523.01
credit and collection policy 1523.02
EMERGENCY VEHICLE (see also

PUBLIC SAFETY VEHICLE)
approaching when stationary ~ 333.031
defined 301.11
following, parking near 331.27
siren, whistle, bell 337.19
speed exceptions 333.06
stop sign or signal, effect 331.20

EMPLOYEES, MUNICIPAL (see also

PUBLIC SERVANT)

applicability 153.01

appointments, promotions,
removals by Mayor  Chtr, IV-5
(B), V-6(F)



23

GENERAL INDEX

EMPLOYEES, MUNICIPAL (Cont.)

System pick-up 153.21
overtime 153.06
police (see POLICE DEPARTMENT)
probationary period Chtr. V-6(D)
sick leave 153.09
travel expenses 153.07
uniform allowance 153.08
vacation 153.15
work week 153.05

ENGINEER, MUNICIPAL
Council meeting attendance 121.01(h)
grades set and checked 1309.10,
1309.11
major subdivision final plat ,
' review 1115.06
Municipal Map 1115.09
ENTERTAINMENT
assemblages over 100

prohibited 509.10
certificate of registration; fee 173.10
tax (see ADMISSIONS TAX)
temporary or transient; '

permit, bond 173.07

bereavement leave 153.10
bonds 153.02
classification of service Chtr.V-6(B)
compensation
basis for 153.03
deferred 153.20
conference expenses 153.07

conflict of interest Chtr. XII-7, 525.15
continuance under new

Charter Chtr. XII-2
Council employees Chtr. I1I-16
definitions 153.04
educational benefit 153.17
family leave 153.11

fireman (see FIRE DEPARTMENT)

holidays : 153.14
hospitalization and medical
coverage 153.12
injury leave 153.13
jury duty 153.07
longevity 153.16
medical leave 153.11
municipal officials; salary 153.18,
153.19

Ohio Public Employees Retirement

EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL

Abbreviated Storm Water Poliution
Prevention Plan
application
. contents

1129.06
1129.10

EROSION AND SEDIMENT

CONTROL (Cont.)
Abbreviated Storm Water Pollution
Prevention Plan {cont.)

development 1128.05
fees 1129.11
required 1125.10
appeals 1129.15
bond 1129.12
compliance 1129.07
conflict 1129.04
definitions - 1129.02
disclaimer of lability 1129.03
enforcement 1129.13
fees 1129.11
nuisances 1129.04
penalty 1129.99
performance standards 1129.09
purpose; scope 1129.01
responsibility 1129.04
severability 1129.04
Storm Water Pollution Prevention
Plan
application 1129.06
contents 1129.08
development 1129.05
fees 1129.11
required 1129.08
violations 1129.14
ETHNIC INTIMIDATION 541.08
EXCAVATIONS
abandoned, protection 521.03
barricades and warning
lights 905.01(b)
bond or deposit 905.01(d), 977.905
damages recoverable 905.03
exceptions to regulations 905.02(a)
heavy equipment, vehicle,
permit fee 205.011
inspection fee 905.02(b)
insurance required 905.01(c)
parking near prohibited 351.03(k)
penalty 905.99
permit; fees 905.01(z), 977.905,
1309.0%
plans submitted; Engineer’s
approval 905.02(b)
EXCISE TAX ON LODGINGS (see
also TAXATION)
appeals 171.06
collection and payment 171.03
confidentiality 171.07
definitions 171.01
late penalty 171.03

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 24

EXCISE TAX ON LODGINGS (Cont.)

levied 171.02

penalty 171.99

records subject to audit 171.03

returns 171.03

rules and regulations 171.05
EXPLOSIVES

blasting (see BLASTING)
containers of; opening,

disposition 1361.07
defined 301.12, 549.01
exceptions 1361.15
fireworks (see FIREWORKS)
handling by employees 1361.13
intoxicant or drug use by

handlers of 1361.08
smoking prohibited near 1361.08
State regulation compliance 1361.14
transporting 339.06

FAIR HOUSING
Administrator 743.07
complaints 743.08
conciliation 743.11
definitions 743.02
exemptions 743.03
fees; bonds; insurance 767.743
Hearing Officer 743.15
hearings; decisions 743.13, 743.14
injunctive relief 743.12
investigation 743.10
judicial relief 743.17
notices 743.05, 743.09
prohibited acts 743.04
purpose 743.01
remedies 743.16, 743.18
Review Board 743.06
severability 743.19

FALSE REPORTS
fire alarms 509.07
inducing panic 509.06

FALSIFICATION

driver’s license application ~ 335.04(e)
false information to
law enforcement officers

generally 525.021

police for traffic citations ~ 303.11

identification card forgery 545.20

license plate registration 335.09(fH)

prohibited - 525.02

FEES -

Architectural Review Board

plan review 1305.11

bicycle license 373.04(d)

2013 Replacement

FEES (Cont.) :
levied 171.02

penalty 171.99
records subject to audit 171.03
returns 171.03
certificate of registration
contractor 1309.05(g)
entertainment or

amusement 173.10
condominium public offering

statement, filing 1379.04
dwelling sewage system

mspection 1365.03
emergency medical services for

non-residents 1523.01
erosion and sediment control ~ 1129.11
fireworks 1521.1519
Flood Plain District property

inquiries 1309.21
landscaping plan 1309.08(b)
Ohio Fire Code 1521.1501
open burning 1521.1511
permit

air conditioning 1309.05(¢)
alarm connections to

police or fire station 971.10
building (see BUILDING PERMIT)

commercial and heavy

vehicle 339.02
demolition 1309.05(b)
driveway construction  1309.05(g)
electrical work 1309.05(d)

_ excavation 905.01, 1309.09
.fences 1157.08(e)
filling or hauling 1309.09
fire hydrant use 1309.17
fireworks exhibition 1519.02(c)
grading 1309.09
heating device 1309.05(e)

heavy equipment, vehicle 905.011

moving building 1309.05(b)
parade or procession 311.02(b)
plumbing 1309.05(c)
rain barrel system 1309.24
satellite dish 1381.03
sidewalk

construction  1309.14, 1309.15
signs 1185.10
snow plows 761.02
soil removal 1309.05(t), 1371.05
street sales 745.05(1)
swimming pool 1309.05(b)
tree removal 1309.05(g)

4\
e



25 GENERAL INDEX
FEES (Cont.) FIRE (Cont.}
recreational vehicle suppression equipment (see
registration 1309.05(g) AUTOMATIC FIRE
Senior Center and Community SUPPRESSION EQUIP-
Room Building use 155.06 MENT)
SEWers 1309.05(c) unfriendly; alarm duties 1501.08

storm water management plan  1128.14
subdivision plats, inspections 1123.03
utility excavation inspection  905.02(b)

video service provider 769.01
Zoning Code application or
petition filing 1149.03
FENCE
maintenance 1353.06
residential districts 1157.08
swimming pool enclosure 1341.12
FINANCE
advertising for bids 123.02
checks, authorized signatures  133.03
contracts (see CONTRACTS)
investments 133.01, 133.05
petty cash funds 133.02
purchases; Council approval 123.02
State law applicable Chtr. IX-1
FINANCE DEPARTMENT
Director (see FINANCE DIRECTOR)
established Chtr. V-1
petty cash fund 133.02
FINANCE DIRECTOR (see also
PUBLIC SERVANT)
appointment; qualifications  Chtr. V-5
assistants Chtr. V-5
duties Chtr. V-5
Income Tax Administrator,
as 175.0302
income tax duties (see
INCOME TAX)
FIRE
alarms (see FIRE ALARM)
arson investigation 141.08
bonfire; permit 1511.05
Code (see OHIO FIRE CODE)
equipment; installers 1501.10
hazards in M-S, O-L and P-D
Districts 1173.08(b)
investigations 141.08

open burning (see OPEN BURNING)
safety inspection fees 1501.14

setting 1501.07
smoke detector (see SMOKE
DETECTOR)
structural damage; insurance
payments 133.04

FIRE ALARM (see also ALARMS)

audibility 1377.10
checking 1377.11(d)
circuit type 1377.12
combination system 1377.08
compliance 1377.01
control equipment 1377.11
definitions 1377.04
equipment

approval 1377.03

installation 1377.02(b), 1377.15

types used 1377.02(a)
false alarm 509.07

fire and intrusion differentiated 971.02
fire station connection 971.03, 971.04
power supplies
battery 1377.07
cord connected 1377.06(c)
emergency 1501.13(F-504.4(B)(4))

primary 1377.05(b), 1377.06
sufficient for 4 minutes 1377.05(a)
required, when 1383.03()
silencing switch - 1377.11
smoke detector (see SMOKE
DETECTOR)
FIREARM (see WEAPONS)
FIRE CHIEF
appointment; duties 141.02
automatic sprinkler rules 1383.02

- fireworks exhibition approval;

permit 1519.02

FIRE DEPARTMENT

alarms (see ALARMS)

apparatus, use of 141.03
appointees terminated; training

expenses reimbursed 141.07
appointments or removals 141.01(g)
authority to issue appearance

citations 131.06
Chief (see FIRE CHIEF)
civil service system,

maintained under Chtr. V-9
clean indoor air enforcement 521.10()
composition 141.01(b)
constitution, rules and

regulations approved 141.05
duties Chir. V-9

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 26

FIRE DEPARTMENT (Cont.)
established Chtr. V-1
equipment used to pump out
private residences 969.01

fire alarm installation,

notified of 1377.15(g)
full-time or part-time
service hours 141.01(c)
immediate notification of fire 1501.08
paramedic training required 141.06
promotions Chtr. V-6(E), (F)
regionalized districts; departments
consolidated Chtr. V-9.1
response outside Village 121.12
FIRE DEPARTMENT, VOLUNTEER
established 141.01(2)
Voluntary Firemen’s Dependents
Fund Board 141.04
FIRE HOSE
driving over 331.28
FIRE HYDRANT
parking near prohibited 351.03(d)
use; permit, fee, deposit 1309.17
FIREMAN
directing traffic 303.02(a)
FIREPLACE, PORTABLE
OUTDOOR 1511.05
FIRE PREVENTION BUREAU 1501.15
FIRE SAFETY INSPECTOR
certified 1501.04
disclosure of true status 1501.09
FIRE STATION
- parking near prohibited 351.03¢)
FIRE TRUCK
approaching when stationary ~ 333.031
following, parking near 331.27
FIREWORKS (see also EXPLOSIVES)
definitions 1519.01
discharge 1519.04
exceptions 1519.05
exhibition
approval 1519.02(a)
bond or insurance 1519.02(c)

inspection of premises  1519.02(b)

permit; fee 1519.02
exhibitor

licensed 1519.02(b)

unlawful conduct 1519.03

2013 Replacement

FIREWORKS (Cont.)
fees 1521.1519
penalty 1519.99
possession 1519.04
sale 1519.04
FLAMMABLE LIQUID
defined 301.14

FLOOD DAMAGE PREVENTION
abrogation and greater

restrictions 1375.08
Administrator designated 1375.13
application of chapter 1375.05
areas of special flood hazard,

establishing 1375.06
compliance 1375.07
definitions 1375.04
development permit

establishment 1375.11

filing exemption 1375.12
factual basis 1375.01
flood hazard reduction

provisions 1375.16
interpretation 1375.09
liability; warning and

disclaimer 1375.10
penalty 1375.99
purpose 1375.02
reducing flood losses 1375.03
variance procedure 1375.15
Village Engineer’s duties and

responsibilities 1375.14

FLOOD DAMAGE REDUCTION
administration 1125.03
appeals 1125.05
definitions 1125.02
enforcement 1125.06
flood hazard reduction

standards 1125.04
flood plain development

permit 1125.03(c)
general provisions 1125.01
penalty 1125.06(c)
variances 1125.05



29 GENERAL INDEX

HOTEL OR MOTEL
arson laws, posting 1501.06
tax (see EXCISE TAX ON
LODGINGS)
HUNTING
prohibited 505.23
HYPODERMIC
possession, dispensing 513.04, 513.10
IDENTIFICATION
refusal to disclose personal
information in public

place 525.18
IDENTIFICATION CARD
forgery 545.20
IMMOBILIZATION ORDER
driving under 333.10
IMPERSONATION
jaw enforcement officer to
defraud 545.16
peace officer, private
policeman 525.03
IMPORTUNING 533.05
IMPOUNDING
bicycles 373.09
dogs 505.07 et seq.
motorized bicycle ' 379.14
private tow-away Zoncs 303.082
vehicle

private residential or
agricultural property ~ 303.081
release; records; charge 303.083
traffic violation 303.08
IMPROVEMENTS (see SUBDIVISION
REGULATIONS)
INCINERATORS (see GARBAGE
DISPOSALS AND
INCINERATORS)
INCOME TAX (see also TAXATION)
additional assessment time

limitation 175.1701
Administrator’s duties
arrange installment
payments 175.2304
compel production of
records 175.2307
determine amount due 175.2305
enforce payment 175.2302

INCOME TAX (Cont.)

Administrator’s duties (Cont.)
investigations 175.2306
make and enforce

regulations 175.2303
receive tax 175.2301
records and

TEpOrts 175.2301, 175.2302
Regional Agency may

perform 175.2311

appeals 175.2503

Board of Review
appeals heard  175.2502, 175.2503
established; members 175.2501
regulations and amendments

approved 175.2502
collection
after chapter terminates ~ 175.2702
at source 175.1302
central facilities 175.2311
less than $1.00 175.1703
unpaid taxes 175.1701
credit 175.1901

declaration of estimated
taxable mcome

filing time 175.1304

form 175.1305

payment to accompany - 175.1306

required 175.1303
definitions 175.0301 et seq.
determination

method 175.0701

Municipality sales defined 175.0702
operating loss

carry-forward 175.0705
rentals 175.0704
total allocations 175.0703
disbursement of funds 175.2101
effective period 175.0501
exemptions 175.0901
failure to procure forms 175.1507
income
not taxed 175.0901
taxable 175.0501
interest and penalties
abatement 175.1504
collection 175.1701
exceptions 175.1503
unpaid tax, on 175.1501, 175.1502
levy 175.0101

limitations on prosecution 175.1506

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 30

INCOME TAX (Cont.)
payment
accompanies declaration  175.1306

collection at source 175.1302
enforcement 175.2302
filing, upon 175.1301
final installment 175.1307
instaliments arranged 175.2304
time extension 175.1308
penalty 175.1505(k)
purpose 175.0101
rate 175.0501
records
compel production of 175.2307
confidentiality 175.2309
refusal to produce 175.2308
taxpayer to retain 175.2310
refunds
less than $1.00 175.1703
of overpayment 175.1301
time fimitations 175.1702
Regional Income Tax
Agency 175.2311
returns
amended 175.1105
annual 175.1307
consolidated 175.1104
due after chapter
terminates 175.2702(b)
employer 175.1302
form and content 175.1102
payment included 175.1301

time extension 175.1103, 175.1308

time of filing 175.1101
separability 175.2701
time extension 175.1308
violations 175.1505

INDECENCY (see OBSCENITY;
SEXUAL OFFENSES)
INITIATIVE
petition Chtr. VII-3
procedure Chtr. VII-1
INSURANCE
driving without 335.072
fraud 545.07
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE
adoption ' 1335.01
amendments 1335.03

2013 Replacement

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE
(Cont.)
conflicts 1335.04
copies 1335.02
penalty 1335.99
INTERSECTION
defined 301.17
obstructing 331.33
parking in 351.03
right of way 331.16, 331.17
shortcutting 331.41
stop signs 313.02, 331.19
turning at 331.10
INTOXICANT, HARMFUL
nitrous oxide in vehicle . 513.11
possessing, using 513.07
INTOXICANTS
consumption of
hours 526.08
motor vehicle, in 529.04
definitions 529.01
low-alcohol beverages 529.06
manufacture permit 529.05
minors purchase, consumption, '
possession 529.021
open container
motor vehicle 529.04
State liquor store,
public places 529.07

permit for sale or manufacture  529.05
sale

hours 529.08
intoxicated persons, to 529.03
minors, to 529.02
permit 529.05
INTOXICATION
disorderly conduct 509.03
driving while intoxicated;
testing 333.01
explosive handlers 1361.08
fireworks exhibitor 1519.03
walking on street '371.09
weapon use 549.03
INVASION OF PRIVACY
voyeurism 533.06
JAIL -
confinement costs reimbursed 501.999
medical care for prisoners 139.06
JAYWALKING 371.03



31 GENERAL INDEX

JUNK MOTOR VEHICLE
impounding 303.08
public or private
property 303.09, 303.10
JURISDICTION 501.05
JUVENILE (see also MINOR)
corruption 533.03

delinquency, contributing to 537.17
displaying material

harmful to 533.15
material harmful to
deception to obtain 533.13
disseminating 533.11
marihuana paraphernalia
sale 513.12

KEYS
motor vehicle

parking, removal  303.03, 351.07

KNIFE (sce WEAPONS)
LANDEFILLS
application; regulations 1363.03
LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT
appointment 1301.05(b)
creation 1301.05(a)
duties ' 1301.05(c)
plan review, approval 1309.08
LANDSCAPING
deposit or bond 1309.061
inspections 1309.061
plan required; filing 1309.08
satellite dish, to conceal 1381.04
LASER POINTING DEVICE
POSSESSION OF Use 537.21
LAW DEPARTMENT
Director (see LAW DIRECTOR)
established Chtr. V-1
LAW DIRECTOR (see also
PUBLIC SERVANT)

appointment; qualifications ~ Chtr. V-4
assistants; special counsel Chtr. V-4
building moving, enforcement 1343.10
chief legal officer, as Chtr. V-4
Council meeting attendance  121.01(h)
Income Tax Board of Review

member 175.2501
ordinances, resotutions and
contracts approved 121.03
LAW ENFORCEMENT
Trust Fund 139.05

LAW ENFORCEMENT OFFICER (see

also PUBLIC SERVANT)
defined 501.01
dereliction of duty 525.12
failure to aid 525.06
false information to 525.021
hampering at emergency 509.05
ignition key removal 303.03
personating 545.16

refusal to disclose personal
information to in public

place 525.18
LIABILITY
criminal
organizational 501.11
personal 501.07
LIBRARY
rights; property damage 545.04
LICENSE (see also PERMIT)
bicycle 373.04
dogs 505.06

driving (see DRIVER'’S LICENSE)
fees (see FEES)

LICENSE PLATES
display 335.09
expired or unlawful; out of state 335.10
illegal

impounding vehicle 303.08

use of 335.11

motorized bicycle 379.01(e)

rear, illumination 337.04

unobstructed 335.10
LIGHTING

off-street parking and loading 1183.11

requirements 1501.13 (F-504.4)
LIGHTS, VEHICLE (see VEHICLE
LIGHTS)
LIMITATION OF PROSECUTION 501.06
LIQUOR (see INTOXICANTS;
INTOXICATION)
LITTERING
motor vehicle, from 331.40
parade oI procession 311.02(¢)
prohibited - 521.08
school, church, shopping
: areas, €tc. 509.09
LOITERING 509.09
LOTS
boundaries identified 1119.171
definitions 1113.14
design criteria 1117.09
dwellings, for
area per family 1181.03
width 1181.06

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 32

LOTS (Cont.)
filling, draining 521.05
gasoline service station 1165.04
Jocal business uses 1165.04
Motorist Service Districts 1173.04
Office-Laboratory Districts 1173.04
Production-Distribution
Districts 1173.04
MANSLAUGHTER, VEHICULAR 537.02
MANUFACTURED HOME
%ccupying moving 331.35
S
building numbering map 1349.01
district and zone map 1153.01

Flood Hazard Boundary Map  1375.09
Municipality, of 1115.09
MARIHUANA (see DRUG ABUSE}
MAYOR (see also PUBLIC SERVANT)
absence Chtr. 1V-7
appointments, promotions,
removals by Chtr. IV-5(B)
civil emergency powers 509.11
compensation
fixed by Council Chtr. III-7
Council meeting attendance Chir. [V-4
‘Council President,
disputes with 121.11
executive powers Chtr. IV-3

judicial powers Chtr. IV-3
municipal government
education Chtr. XII-2
Ordinance Review Committee
member 125.02
Planning and Zoning Commission
member Chtr. V-11(A)
qualifications Chtr. IV-2
Records Commission member  157.01
removal Chtr. IV-9
supervision of and advice from
Activities Committee 131.03
Citizens Advisory
Comunittee 131.04
Senior Center and Community
Room Committee 131.02
term Chtr. IV-1

2013 Replacement

MAYOR (Cont.)

Traffic Code :
powers 305.03, 305.05
records 305.06
traffic control device authority  305.01
vacancy Chtr. IV-8
veto powers Chtr. IV-6

MEETING (see also individual
subject involved)
disturbing lawful 509.04
MEETINGS, OPEN PUBLIC (see also
individual subject involved)

advance notification 103.04
definitions 103.01
executive sessions exempt 103.05
location 103.02(b)

special; news media notified 103.02{(c)
Village calendar

meeting dates on 103.02(a)
posting and mailing 103.03
MENACING (see also THREATS)
aggravated : 537.05
physical harm 537.06
stalking, by 537.051
MINI-BIKE (see ALL PURPOSE
VEHICLE)
MINOR (see also JUVENILE)
contributing to delinquency of ~ 537.17
criminal child enticement 537.16
custody interference 537.18
curfew (see CURFEW)
distributing to
harmful intoxicants 513.11

electric personal assistive
mobility device use 371.12(b)(c)

endangering 537.07
firearm purchase 549.07
fireworks or sparkler
sale to 1519.04(d)
intoxicants
purchase; possession 529.021
sales 529.02, 529.06
pornographic material,
possession of 533.16
tobacco product sales {0 521.11
MISDEMEANOR (see OFFENSE
MISSILES - 549.09
MOBILE HOME
occupying moving 331.35

MOPED (see MOTORIZED BICYCLE)
MOTORCYCLE
brakes A 337.18
defined 301.19



35

GENERAL INDEX

OFFICE-LABORATORY DISTRICTS

(see also ZONING DISTRICTS)

applicability of other

regulations 1173.11(a)
building height 1173.06
conflicting regulations 1173.11(b)
development plans 1173.10
established; intent 1173.01
fire and explosive hazards  1173.08(b} -
lot area 1173.04
performance standards 1173.08
regulations established;

conformance 1173.02
Sewers 1173.08(c)
uses permitted 1173.03(b)
yards 1173.05

OFFICIALS, MUNICIPAL (see
PUBLIC SERVANT)
OFF-STREET LOADING -

illumination 1183.11
landscaping or fence 1183.10(e)
location and design 1183.09(b)
plan approval 1183.12
required; continuation of 1183.09
schedule of requirements 1183.09(¢c)
space required 1183.09(a)

OFE-STREET PARKING AND LOADING

access drives 1183.08
approval of plans 1183.12
definitions 1183.02
illumination 1183.11
improvements 1183.10
land banking 1183.06
loading facilities 1183.09
maintepance
penalty 1355.99
required 1355.02
responsibility 1355.01
violation notice 1355.03
parking facilities 1183.03, 1183.04
purpose 1183.01
schedule of requirements 1183.05
uses 1183.07

OFE-STREET PARKING AND

LOADING (Cont.}
zoning districts
Planned Residential
Development 1159.06
OHIO BUILDING CODE (see
BUILDING CODE, OHIO)
OHIO FIRE CODE
adoption 1501.01
amendments 1501.13
applicable to 1501.03
arson laws, posting 1501.06
Building Code supersedes 1501.12
compliance 1501.05
conflict 1501.12
copies 1501.11
enforcement; citations 1501.04
fees 1521.1501
fire
equipment; installers 1501.10
safety inspection fees 1501.14
setting 1501.07
unfriendly; alarm duties 1501.08
Fire Safety Inspector
certified 1501.04
disclosure of true status 1501.09
penalty 1501.99
purpose 1501.02
OHIO PLUMBING CODE
adoption by reference 1325.01
application 1325.03
conflict 1325.05
copies 1325.04
penalty 1325.99
purpose 1325.02
OIL WELLS (see GAS AND OIL WELLS)
ONE-WAY STREET 331.30
OPEN BURNING (see also FIRE)
bonfires; permit 1511.05
definitions 1511.01
EPA notice and
permission  1511.03, 1511.04
fees 1521.1511
penalty 1511.99
portable outdoor fireplaces 1511.05
prohibited
air alert, warning,
emergency 1511.02(2)

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 36

OPEN BURNING (Cont.)
prohibited (Cont.)
State, local regulations  1511.02(b)
restrictions 1511.03
OPERATOR’S LICENSE (see
DRIVER’S LICENSE)
ORDINANCE REVIEW COMMITTEE

compensation 125.03
creation 125.01
meetings; quorum 125.05
membership; term 125.02

purpose 125.04
ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS
adoption or passage Chtr. III-8(A)

amendments 121.03(c)
Codified (see CODIFIED
ORDINANCES)

effective date Chtr, HI-11
electorate, submitted to Chtr. I11-14
emergency measures Chtr. I1I-11
form; enactment method Chtr. 1II-10
initiative Chtr. VII-1
introduction 121.03(b)
Law Director’s approval 121.03(a)
Mayor’s approval or veto  Chitr. V-6

one subject each;’
titles Chtr. TII-10(C), 121.03(b)
123

posting .01
public notice and hearing  Chtr. I1-13
reading required Chtr. [II-10(C),

121.03(b)

referendum
effective date suspended Chtr. VIi-4
effect on emergency

mMeasures Chtr. VII-6
measures subject to Chtr. VII-5
petition Chtr. VII-3
procedure Chtr. VII-2

referrals, mandatory Chtr. I-12

Review Committee (see ORDINANCE

REVIEW COMMITTEE)

rules suspended 121.03(d)

voting on 121.05

zoning amendments Chtr. III-13, 14
ORGANIZATION

liability 501.11

penalty 501.99(b)

personal accountability 501.12
oVl

driving under suspension 335.071

prohibitions 333.01
PARADE 311.02
PARAMEDICS 141.06

2013 Replacement

PARKING
angle 351.05
bicycle 373.07(p), (@
brake, setting 351.07

commercial vehicles in

residential districts 1157.07
double 351.03(1)
emergency, safety vehicle,

near 331.27
front yards or tree lawn 351.13
handicapped persons 351.12
impounding vehicle 303.08
key removal 303.03, 351.07
liability for violation 351.02
loading zone 351.09
locations for handicapped

‘ persons 351.04
night hours 351.09
off-street (see OFF-STREET
-~ PARKING)
opening door on traffic side 351.08
owner prima-facie liable 351.02
nonliability, lease

defense 305.05
parallel 351.04
penalty 351.99
posted private property 351.11
prohibited places 351.03, 351.10
recreationa] vehicle (see

RECREATIONAL VEHICLE)
removal of unattended vehicle  351.01
residential districts, in 1157.07
selling, washing or repairing

vehicle 351.06
stopping engine 351.07

PARKS
- Park and Recreation
Improvement Fund 1309.22

PARKS AND RECREATION BOARD

Chairman 143.02
established Chtr. V-1
members
appointment,
qualifications Chtr. V-2
term; removal 143.02
powers; duties 143.04
reconstituted 143.01
Standing Rules 143.03
PARKS AND RECREATION
DEPARTMENT
creation 142.01
Director 142.02



45 GENERAL INDEX

SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS (Cont.)
improvements (Cont.)

curbs and gutters 1119.0%b)
design standards 1119.14
developer failure to
complete 1119.18
developer responsible 1119.02
drainage facilities 1119.04
driveways, curb cuts 1119.0%(c)
electric service 1119.07
extra-size, off-site 1119.13
flood areas 1125.11
gas fuel system 1119.08
grading 1119.03
mspection fee 1123.03(c)
insurance 1119.17
lot boundaries identified 1119.171
maintenance bond 1119.16(b)
monument boxes 1119.10
parking areas 1119.09(d)
pavement 1119.09(a)
purpose 1119.01
sediment pollution control 1119.20
sewers 1119.04, 1119.05
sidewalks 1115.09(e)
street name signs 1119.12
street trees 1119.11
telephone service 1119.07
temporary pavement 1119.19
trees retained 1119.03(c)
water service 1119.06
industrial subdivisions 1115.08
intent 1115.01
interpretation as minimum
requirements 1111.04
land for public and common
use 1115.07, 1121.05
land planning 1117.02
land transfer before
recording 1123.99(c)
lots, design criteria 1117.09
major subdivisions
application 1115.05(b)
classification 1115.05(a)
Commission action 1115.05(c)
final plat 1115.06, 1121.04
preliminary plan 1121.03

SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS (Cont.)

minor subdivision

application; approval

classification
recording
sketch plan

multi-family subdivisions

parks, playgrounds,
schools
penalty

planning criteria intent
plans, maps and plats intent

preliminary plan fees
procedure

1115.03
1115.03(a)
1115.04
1121.02
1115.08

1117.16{a)
1123.99
1117.01
1121.01
1123.03

outline Part 11, Title 3, App. A

purpose and intent 1111.02
relation to other laws 1111.03
resubdivision, replatting or
vacation 1115.10
severability 1111.05
streets
apartment developments 1117.05
business developments 1117.06
industrial subdivisions 1117.07
name signs 1119.12
pavement 1119.09
planning criteria 1117.03
residential areas 1117.04
temporary pavement 1119.19
title 1111.01
unplatted areas; hearings 1123.02
utility easements 1117.10(b)
SUNSCREENED VERICLE
WINDOWS 337.28
SWIMMING POOL
cleaning 1341.05
compliance 1341.14
construction regulations 1341.04
definitions 1341.01
disinfecting 1341.07
fences; permit 1341.12
home pool exceptions 1341.11
lifeguard 1341.10
overflow trough 1341.03
penalty 1341.99

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 46

SWIMMING POOL. (Cont.)
permit
application 1341.02
fee 1309.05(b)
personal cleanliness 1341.08
public or club; approval 1341.13
records 1341.07
rental of bathing suit,
towel, etc. 1341.09
sewer connection 1341.03
sterilization 1341.06

SWITCHBLADE (see WEAPONS)
TAMPERING (see also PROPERTY

DESTRUCTION)
coin machine 545.12
criminal mischief 541.04
{ibrary; museuny; archival

institution 545.04
records 545.14
traffic control device 313.08

TAXATION

admissions (see ADMISSIONS TAX)
hotels or motels (see EXCISE TAX
ON LODGINGS)

income (see INCOME TAX)
limitations Chir. IX-2
TELECOMMUNICATION RIGHT OF
WAY PERMITS
amendments 709.03
form 709.02
penalty 709.99
required 709.01
schedule 767.709
TELECOMMUNICATIONS
harassment 537.10
TELEPHONE
harassment 537.10, 537.11
lines in subdivisions 1119.07
misuse of 911 system 537.12
threats by 537.11
TELEVISION
cable (see CABLE TELEVISION
REGULATIONS)
satellite dish
defined 1381.01
location; landscaping 1381.04
penalty 1381.99
permit
application; fee 1381.03
required 1381.02

2013 Replacement

TEMPORARY PROTECTION
ORDER 537.15
TEXTING
prohibited while driving 331.44

THEATER (see ENTERTAINMENT)
THEFT
alarms (see ALARMS)

criminal tools, possession 545.19
definitions 545.01
felony exceptions 545.03
library; museum; archival
institution 545.04

petty 545.05
property

defined 501.01Q)

determining value 545.02

police held, disposition of 139.04

receiving stolen 545.18

unauthorized use 545.08
shoplifters 545.04
vehicle

alarm signal 337.19

unauthorized use 545.06

THREATS (see also MENACING)

coercion 537.09
telephone 537.11

THROUGH STREET (see STREET)
TIRES (see VEHICLE EQUIPMENT)
TOBACCO PRODUCTS

sales to minors 521.11

smoking restrictions 521.10
TOOL AND EQUIPMENT LENDING

PROGRAM

commencement; continuation 975 .03

established 975.01

permit fees; bond; insurance 977.975

terms and conditions 975.02
TOW-AWAY ZONES

private 303.082
TOWING

requirements 339.07
TOY VEHICLES

attaching to vehicles 373.07(0)

streets, on 311.03
TRAFFIC CODE

Council, powers reserved to 305.07

definitions Ch. 301

government vehicles 303.07



47 GENERAL INDEX

TRAFFIC CODE (Cont.)

Mayor
powers 305.03, 305.05
records 305.06
misdemeanor classification  303.99(a)
penalties 303.99(b), 305.99
road workers, equipment
excepted 303.04
TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICE
advertising on 313.07
alteration, removal 313.08
ambiguous 313.10
avoiding 331.39
beacon; hybrid beacon 301.031
bicycle riders’ compliance 373.07(a)
center line, painted 313.08
conformity with State Manual  305.02
Council powers 305.01
defined 301.46
hidden 313.07
highway traffic signal 301.161
lane-use control
signal indications 313.04
nonworking 313.10
obedience required 313.01
parking near prohibited 351.03(g)
pedestrian control signal 313.05
placement authority 305.01
portable signal preemption
devices prohibited 313.12
possession, unlawful 313.11
posting required 305.04
removal, injury 313.08
signs obstructing;
resembling 1185.05(f)
stop sign or signal
emergency vehicle 331.20
operation at 331.19
placing 313.02
public safety vehicle 331.20
right of way 331.19
through streets, signs at 313.02
unauthorized 313.07
yield signs
operation at 331.18
placing 313.02
TRAFFIC SIGNAL (see TRAFFIC
CONTROL DEVICE)

TRAILER
construction trailer (see
CONSTRUCTION)
definitions 1113.23
occupying moving 331.35
recreational vehicle (see
RECREATIONAL VEHICLE)

TREE LAWN (see STREET LAWN)
TREES

destruction 541.06
removal or destruction
bond 1359.07
penalty 1359.99
regulated 1359.01
restraining injunction 1359.06
removal permit
appeal 1359.05
application 1359.02
authorities’
recommendations 1359.03
fee 1309.05(g)
hearings 1359.04
required 1359.01
sprinkling ban 935.01
street trees 1119.11
subdivisions, retained in 1119.03(c)
TRESPASS
aggravated 541.051
land or premises . 541.05
vehicle 545.06
voyeurism 533.06
TRUCK (seec COMMERCIAL AND
HEAVY VEHICLE)
UNSAFE STRUCTURES
appeals; Council hearings 1353.11
Architectural Review Board
hearing 1353.09
cost recovery, Municipal 1353.16
definitions 1353.01
demolition
costs a lien 1353.13
required 1353.02(c)
emergency authority 1353.14
insect or rodent infestation 1353.05
legal action 1353.15

2013 Replacement



GENERAL INDEX 48

UNSAFE STRUCTURES (Cont.) UTILITIES (see also individual
maintenance (see DWELLINGS) utility involved)
order to vacate; posting signs  1353.10 blasting, notified of 1361.05
penalty 1353.99 building moving. letters of
property areas, exterior 1353.07 clearance 1343.05(d)
repairs easements 1117.10(b)
failure to make 1353.13 excavations 905.02
inspections; compliance 1353.12 franchise Chtr. VIII
required 1353.02(c) recreational vehicle connections
violation notice 1353.08 prohibited 1373.03
URBAN SEDIMENT POLLUTION U TURN
ABATEMENT (see STORMWATER regulated 331.12
MANAGEMENT AND URBAN VANDALISM 541.04
SEDIMENT POLLUTION VARIANCES
ABATEMENT) Board of Appeals granting 1105.02
USE REGULATIONS defined 1113.25
aCCessory uses filing fee 1149.03
Flood Plain District 1177.14(d) flood damage 1125.05, 1375.15
Local Business District  1165.03(c) Flood Plain District 1177.19(d)
Motorist Service sign regulations 1185.09
Districts 1173.03(a) single family residences 1105.02
Office-Laboratory zoning, Councii powers Chtr. V-12.1
Districts 1173.03(b) VEHICLE (see MOTOR VEHICLE)
Production-Distribution VEHICLE EQUIPMENT
Districts 1173.03(c) air cleaner 337.25
residential districts 1157.06 all purpose vehicle 375.02
classification of uses 1153.02 bicycles 373.06
definitions 1113.24 brakes 337.18
exceptions 1149.02 bumpers 337.01(d), 337.29
Flood Plain District 1177.13 chains 339.10
Local Business Districts 1165.03 child restraint system 337.26
Motorist Service Districts ~ 1173.03(a) directional signals required 337.30
nonconforming exceptions 337.01(c)
cessation of 1149.07 exhaust noise 331.36
definitions 1113.17 horn, siren 337.19
Flood Plain District 1177.21 lights (see VEHICLE LIGHTS)
off-street parking and loading 1183.07 ~ loads (see VEHICLE LOADS)
Office-Laboratory motorcycle 377.01
Districts 1173.03(b) motorcycle, off-highway 375.02
Planned Residential Development motorized bicycle 379.01
District 1159.03 mud flaps 339.05
Production-Distribution muffler
Districts 1173.03(c) motorized bicycle 379.06
residential districts motor vehicle, motorcycle  337.20
accessory uses 1157.06 noise 331.36
Apartment House 1157.04 snowmobile, all purpose
Single-Family House 1157.01 vehicle 375.02
Two-Family House 1157.02 rear red reflector 337.05
Small Office Building rear-view mirror 337.21
District - 1169.03 red flag or light, on load 337.08

2013 Replacement

(E—



Tt

56C COMPARATIVE SECTION TABLE
Ord. No. Date C.0. Section Ord. No. Date C.0O. Section
2007-28 12-17-07 1179.01 to 1179.05, 2009-25  7-20-09  1521.1501,
1179.99 1521.1511,
2007-30  12-17-07 1501.01 1521.1519
2007-44 10-23-07 907.03 2009-26  7-20-09  1519.02(c)
2008-01 1-22-08 767.01 2009-27 7-20-09 1501.14(a)
2008-04 4-21-08 1130.01 to 1130.10 2009-28 7-20-09  Repeals 747.01 to
2008-05 4-2i-08 1128.01 t0 1128.18, 747.05, 747.99
' 1128.99; repeals 2009-29 8-17-09 739.03(a)(11)
Ch. 1127 200930 8-17-09 709.02
2008-06 4-21-08 1129.01to0 1129.15, 2009-31 8-17-09 745.05()
1129.99 2009-32 8-17-09 761.02
2008-07 2-18-08 131.05(c) 2009-33 8-17-09 767.701 to
2008-08 1-22-08 1335.01, 1335.03 ' 767.766
2008-11 1-22-08 1333.01 2000-44 11-16-09 1371.01 to 1371.07,
2008-12 2-18-08 103.01, 103.02, 1371.99
121.01, 123.01, 2009-46 9-21-09 739.01
127.01, 137.01, 2009-49 10-19-09 1309.05(g)(5)
153.21, 505.08, 2009-52  11-16-09 133.02(b) :
943.02, 943.05, 2009-53  11-5-09  153.1%(g)
1119.20 2009-54 11-16-09 1523.01, 1523.02
2008-16 3-17-08  131.03(c) 2009-55 12-21-09 905.011
2008-27 8-18-08 1381.01, 1381.03 20009-56  12-21-09 1179.01 to 1179.06,
2008-32 8-18-08 1185.14(c) 1179.99
2008-39 12009 977.01 2009-58 12-21-09 505.11
2008-40 1-20-09 1313.01 to 1313.07, 2009-5¢ 12-21-09 977.905(c)
1313.99 2009-60 12-21-09 Repeals 945.01 to
2008-41 1-20-09 905.01 to 905.03, 945.37
905.99 2009-61 12-21-09 1116.17
2008-42 1-20-09 1309.23 2009-62  12-21-09 1309.23
2009-03 1-20-09 131.05(c) 2009-63 12-21-09 1343.05
2009-04 2-16-09 1523.01, 1523.02 - 2009-64 12-21-09 1361.02
2009-05 3-16-09 Repeals 311.04 2009-65 12-21-09 1519.02(c)
2009-06 3-16-09 745.05(g) 2009-68 12-21-09 153.03(b), 153.06(h),
2009-07 3-16-09 Repeals 733.04 153.15(e)
2009-11 4-20-09 745.9G 2009-69 2-15-10 175.0501
2009-12 42009 373.06, 373.07 2010-02  3-15-10  175.1302(a)
2009-13  3-16-09 153.11 2010-21 5-17-10 1501.01(a)
2009-19  6-15-09 139.06 2010-27 6-21-10 Repeals 153.03(b)
2009-20 6-15-09 Repeals 1339.01, 2010-32 10-19-10 1321.02, 1321.99
1339.02, 1339.99 2010-33  8-16-10 1389.01 to 1389.05,
2009-21 6-15-09 Repeals 1345.01 1389.99
.to 1345.08, 2010-35 8-16-10 1125.011to0 1125.06
1345.99 2010-41 1-18-11 1183.01to 1183.12
2009-22 7-20-09 1501.13
2000-23  7-20-09 1501.15
2009-24 7-20-09 Repeals 931.01,
931.02

2013 Replacement



COMPARATIVE SECTION TABLE

56D

Ord. No. Date
2011-01  1-18-11
2011-07  5-16-11
2011-14 4
2011-15 4-25-11
2011-16 4
2011-17  4-25-11
2011-18 6-20-11

2011-19 6-20-11

2011-20 5-16-11
2011-22  5-16-11
201126  5-16-11
2011-31 10-17-11
2011-32  10-17-11
2011-33  10-17-11

2011-42  12-19-11

2011-43  12-19-11
2011-44  12-19-11
2012-01  1-17-12
2012-02  1-17-12
201203 1-17-12
2012-16 7-16-12
2012-17  7-16-12
2012-19  7-16-12
2012-28 11-19-12
2012-29 11-19-12
2012-31  11-19-12
2013-02 2-19-13

2013 Replacement

C.0. Section
Repeals Ch. 907
1523.01, 1523.02
157.01 to 157.05
1525.01

1377.01 t0 1377.05
Repeals 1173.07
1128.01 to 1128.18,
1128.99

1129.01 to 1129.15,
1129.99

153.01 to 153.21
139.07

131.01

Repeals 1309.22
1363.02

1309.25, 1391.01
to 1391.14
1501.01; repeals
1501.13

1325.01

1329.01

Repeals 131.05
Repeals 131.08
Repeals 131.07
1185.14

1185.10

123.02

139.04

171.04

153.13

331.43



62A TABLES OF SPECIAL QRDINANCES
TABLE B - EASEMENTS (Cont.)
Ord. No. Date Description
Res.
88-64 12-19-88 Authorizing acceptance of easement from James T. and Jane M.
Krivanek for repair and maintenance of a storm sewer on
R Permanent Parcel No. 831-19-48.
es.
89-46 8-21-89 From Milan and Maria Buzdon for drainage channel
improvement at 6848 Creekwood Lane.
Res.
89-47 8-21-89 From Dennis and Laura Cardarelli for drainage channel
improvement at 6878 Creekwood Lane.
Res.
89-48 8-21-89 From Bruce and Helene Finke for drainage channel improvement
at 6868 Creekwood Lane.
Res.
89-49 8-21-89 From Robert and Shirley Newkirk for drainage channel
improvement at 6858 Creekwood Lane.
Res.
89-50 8-21-89 From Charles and Patricia Grose! for drainage channel
improvement at 6877 Deepwood Lane.
Res.
89-63 9-18-89 From Progressive Insurance Co. for traffic sign pole on Wilson
Mills Rd.
Res. .
89-64 9-18-89 From Transcon Builders, Inc. for traffic sign pole on Wilson
Mills Rd.
Res.
91-32 3-25-91 From Village Trails Development Co. for drainage channel on
Wilson Mills Rd.
Res. '
91-44 6-26-91 From Village Trails Development Co. for water main in Village
Trails Subdivision No. 1.
Res.
91-45 6-26-91 From Village Trails Development Co. for water main in Village
Trails Subdivision No. 2.
92-33 9-21-92 Release and replacement of easements for water roain installation
and maintenance for Progressive Insurance project.
94-40 6-20-94 Appropriates easement in Permanent Parcel Nos. 831-28-001 and
" 831-30-001 for water detention facility.
97-31 8-11-97 Accepts easement for detention basin purposes from the City
School District.
97-34 9-15-97 Approves easement between Beta Business Mall and Cleveland
for installation and maintenance of water main to supply water
Sservice.
99-03 2-15-99 Authorizes acquisition of r-o-w easement for portions of
properties of G. and J. Rivers on S.0.M. Center Rd.
2000-13 5-15-00 Authorizes acceptance of easements (ingress, egress, parking and
utilities) for Governor’s Village site. '
2000-40 9-18-00 Authorizes electric utility easement with First Energy on N side
of Parkview Dr.

2013 Replacement



TABLES OF SPECIAL ORDINANCES 628

TABLE B - EASEMENTS ( Cont. )

Ord. No. Date Description
2002-11 4-22-02 Grants water line easement to Cuyahoga County Bd. of

Commissioners and City of Cleveland in conjunction with widening
of S.0.M. Center Rd. between Wilson Mills Rd. N to White Rd.

2002-12 4-22-02 Accepts grant of water line casement from Cleveland Electric
Tlluminating Co. in conjunction with widening of S.0.M. Center
Rd. between Wilson Mills Rd. N to White Rd.

2002-18 5-20-02 Authorizes granting easement for ingress/egress and sign purposcs
to Governor’s Village, LLC over Mayfield Village property
fronting along North Commons Blvd. (PPN 831-05-135and 831-05-
44).

2002-38 10-21-02 Grants various easements to East Ohio Gas Co. d/b/a Dominion
East Ohio for relocation of gas pipe line in connection with S.0.M.
Center Rd. widening project.

2004-09 2-16-04 Grants various easements to East Ohio Gas Co. d/b/a Dominion
East Ohio for relocation of gas pipe line in connection with $.0.M.
Center Rd. widening project.

2005-38 8-22-05 Directs entering bike path easement agreement with ATK Mayfield
Village LLC and SOM Court Development Corp. _

2005-39 8-22-05 Directs entering conservation, bike path and bio-detention area
easement agreement with AIK Mayfield Viliage LLC and SOM
Court Development Corp.

2005-50 11-21-05 Authorizes entering easement termination agreement terminating

easement of 4-28-80 between Village and P. Galier and E.C. Carlini
for water main at 651 Beta Drive.

2008-09 1-22-08 Authorizes entering into an easement agreement with Progressive
Direct Insurance Co. for the right of the Village to obtain an
easement over Progressive property and for Progressive to obtain an
easement over Village property.

2009-40 8-17-09 Accepts release of a certain easement previously reserved for street
and utility purposes located along the premises known as Wiley
Park (Permanent Parcel No. 831-13-011).

2010-05 1-19-10 Directs entering into easement for water meter vault on S.0.M.
Center Rd. with Cleveland Division of Water relative to
construction of Mayfield Village Police Station.

2011-38 10-17-11 Authorizing a standard easement for the installation and
maintenance of a water main for the purpose of supplying water
service at the Mayfield City School District High School.

2012-07 3-19-12 Directs entering into a hike and bike trail access easement
agreement with the Board of Trustees of the Cuyahoga County
Public Library.

2012-08 3-19-12 Directs entering into an access easement agreement with the Board

of Trustees of the Cuyahoga County Public Library (“Library™) for
the purposes of parking, ingress and egress to the Library’s

property.

2013 Replacement



£8C TABLES OF SPECIAL ORDINANCES

TABLE F- LEASE OF REAL PROPERTY

Ord. No. Date Description

202 1-19-42 Certain quarters in City of South Euclid as headquarters for
Civilian Report Area No. 17.

422 11-6-52 Premises from Lucretria Van Curen for ice skating rink.

673 - 9-21-59 Terminates lease designating Elizabeth Dunbar as custodian at
6609 Wilson Mills Rd.

925 1-3-66 Premises on Wilson Mills Rd. for ice skating rink.

Res.

725 5-20-68 Approximately 10 acres from Cuyahoga County for recreational

purposes.

69-40 10-9-6%9 Space at 6675 Wilson Mills Rd. for Police Dept.

70-15 3-16-70 Terminates lease with Board of Cuyahoga County Commissioners
for 1and known as Cuyahoga County Auditor’s Permanent Parcel
831-40-1.

87-2 1-19-87 Parcel in Wiley Park to Mayfield Historical Society for relocation
of George Bennet House.

98-02 1-19-98 Authorizes lease with Whiting Turner Contracting Co. for
Parkview Golf Course club house at 320 SOM Center Rd.

88-35 10-19-98 Authorizes lease of real property at 386 S.0.M. Center Rd.

99-41 11-15-99 Authorizes lease of real property at 386 S.O.M. Center Rd.

2003-20 6-16-03 Directs lease with Mayfield City School District Bd. of Education
to lease its Central Administration Building.

2004-47 10-18-04 Directs lease with Word of Grace Church for space within
Mayfield Village Civic Center for religious services.

2006-42 9-25-06 Authorizes a lease agreement for 6827 Thornapple Drive with
James Deacon.

2006-45 10-23-06 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6492
Wilson Mills Road with Ruth and James Vitek.

2006-46 10-23-06 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6492
Wilson Mills Road with Ruth and James Vitek.

2006-48 10-23-06 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6522
Wilson Mills Road with Shirley Shatten.

2006-53 12-18-06 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6484
Wilson Mills Road with John and Cathlyn Murphy.

2007-03 1-29-07 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6536
Wilson Mills Road with Stephanie Kozel.

2007-08 3-26-07 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6434
Highland Road with Wes and Jennifer Shofner.

2007-13 4-30-07 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6484
Wilson Mills Road with Doreen Difiore.

2007-42 9-25-07 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6827
Thornapple Drive with James Deacon.

2007-46 10-23-07 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6492
Wilson Mills Road with Ruth and James Vitek, Trustees.

2007-48 10-23-07 Authorizes a lease agreement for real estate located at 6522

Wilson Mills Road with Shirley Shatten.

2013 Replacement



TABLES OF SPECIAL ORDINANCES 68D

TABLE F- LEASE OF REAL PROPERTY (Cont.)

Ord. No. Date
2007-53 12-18-07
2008-14 3-17-08
2008-37 10-20-08
2008-38 10-20-08
2000-17 4-20-09
2009-57 12-21-09
2010-07 2-15-10
2010-39 10-18-10
2012-20 6-18-12
2012-21 6-18-12

2013 Replacement

Description
Authorizes a lease agreement for the real estate located at 6484

Wilson Mills Road with John and Cathlyn Murphy.

Authorizes a lease agreement for the real estate located at 470
S.0.M. Center Road with Hugh and Michelle Shannon.
Authorizes lease agreement with James Deacon to lease real
estate located at 6827 Thornapple Drive.

Authorizes lease agreement with Edwin Scott Nethery and Regina
M. Nethery to lease real estate located at 691 S.0.M. Center
Road.

Authorizes lease agreement with Lenny Tierney and Terry
Tierney to lease real estate located at 6500 Wilson Mills Road.
Authorizes lease agreement with George Ballash to lease real
estate located at 6826 Meadowood Drive.

Directs lease agreement with Cuyahoga East Vocational
Education Consortium (*CEVEC”) to lease real estate at 6532
White Rd. .

Directs lease agreement with R. Heidenthal and C. Olivo to lease
real estate located at 6536 Wilson Mills Road.

Directs entering into a lease agreement with John Dasher for the
purpose of leasing the real estate located at 6120 Wilson Mills
Road.

Directs entering into a lease agreement with Chad LaGrasso for
the purpose of leasing the real estate located at 6128 Wilson Mills
Road.



